
 
 

 
Cline Williams Wright Johnson & Oldfather, L.L.P. is pleased to announce the addition 
of new attorneys and a second Colorado office: 
 
Nathan D. Clark graduated from Wabash College in Indiana (B.A.) in 2003 and the 
University of Nebraska College of Law (J.D., with high distinction) in 2015. Nate was 
Editor-in-Chief of the Nebraska Law Review in 2014-2015. He is a member of the 
Order of the Coif.  Nate served as judicial law clerk to the Honorable C. Arlen Beam of 
the United States Court of Appeals for the Eighth Circuit for two years before joining 
the firm. His practice will focus on general litigation matters and an appellate practice. 
 
Alison K. Janecek is a graduate of the University of Denver (B.S.B.A., cum laude) in 
2014 and the University of Nebraska College of Law (J.D., with high distinction) in 
2017.  Alison was Executive Editor of the Nebraska Law Review in 2016-2017. She is a 
member of Order of the Coif.  Alison will focus her practice on general transactional 
matters. 

Christopher G. Lehrer graduated from the Colorado State University (B.A.) in 2014 
and the University of Iowa College of Law (J.D., with distinction) in 2017. Chris 
published “Ensuring Competition Law Enforcement under International Trade 
Agreements,” in Transnational Law & Contemporary Problems, summer 2017. His 
practice will focus on general transactional matters in the Fort Collins office. 

Jennie Akerlund Kuehner rejoined the firm in October, 2017. She was a member of 
the firm from 2000 to 2011.  She will return to working in the Aurora and Lincoln 
offices.  Jennie graduated from the University of Nebraska College of Law, with high 
distinction, in 2000 and is a member of Order of the Coif. She practices in the areas of 
both transactional and litigation covering a variety of issues. Her litigation practice 
focuses primarily on commercial and business issues. Jennie also advises clients in 
the areas of estate planning, probate and trust administration, business 
organizations, and business transactions. 

 
On September 1, 2017, Cline Williams added an office in Holyoke, Colorado and four 
lawyers who will continue to work in Holyoke and Fort Collins: 
 
Russell J. Sprague is a graduate of Colorado State University and a 2008 graduate of 
the University of Nebraska College of Law. Russell’s practice focuses on business 
transactions, business organization and structuring, real estate transactions, estate 
planning, and probate and trust administration. His litigation practice focuses 
primarily on commercial/business issues, real estate, employment, franchise/ 
distribution, and probate litigation.  Russell will practice in both the Fort Collins and 
the Holyoke offices. 
 
David O. Colver is a 1975 graduate of the University of Denver College of Law.  
David’s practice focuses on estate planning, taxation, and probate and trust 
administration. David also has extensive experience handling complex real estate and 



business transactions, as well as business organization and structuring.  David will 
continue to practice in the Holyoke office. 

 
Kimbra L. Killin is a 1994 graduate of the University of Denver College of 
Law.  Kimbra’s practice primarily focuses on agricultural and real estate issues, 
probate and estate administration, estate planning, and business organization and 
structuring. Kim currently serves as the county judge for Phillips County, 
Colorado. She will continue to practice in the Holyoke office. 
 
Tammy I. Kelley is a 2014 graduate of the University of Denver College of Law. 
Tammy has a transactional and estate planning practice.  Tammy will continue to 
practice in the Holyoke office. 
 
Established in 1857, Cline Williams, a full service law firm, presently has 63 attorneys 
representing and assisting individual and institutional clients. The firm currently has 
33 lawyers included in one or more of the notable best lawyers lists published in the 
United States. With the addition of a second Colorado office, the firm has six offices 
across Nebraska in Omaha, Lincoln, Aurora and Scottsbluff, and Fort Collins and 
Holyoke Colorado. 
 
To learn more about the firm, our attorneys, and information on current issues that 
may impact our clients, visit our website at www.clinewilliams.com. 
 
  



 
 
Cline Williams is pleased to announce both the addition of an office in Holyoke, 
Colorado and lawyers who will work in Holyoke and Fort Collins: 

Christopher G. Lehrer graduated from the Colorado State University (B.A.) in 2014 
and the University of Iowa College of Law (J.D., with distinction) in 2017. Chris 
published “Ensuring Competition Law Enforcement under International Trade 
Agreements,” in Transnational Law & Contemporary Problems, summer 2017. His 
practice will focus on general transactional matters in the Fort Collins office. 
 
Russell J. Sprague is a graduate of Colorado State University and a 2008 graduate of 
the University of Nebraska College of Law. Russell’s practice focuses on business 
transactions, business organization and structuring, real estate transactions, estate 
planning, and probate and trust administration. His litigation practice focuses 
primarily on commercial/business issues, real estate, employment, franchise/ 
distribution, and probate litigation.  Russell will practice in both the Fort Collins and 
the Holyoke offices. 
 
David O. Colver is a 1975 graduate of the University of Denver College of Law.  
David’s practice focuses on estate planning, taxation, and probate and trust 
administration. David also has extensive experience handling complex real estate and 
business transactions, as well as business organization and structuring.  David will 
continue to practice in the Holyoke office. 

 
Kimbra L. Killin is a 1994 graduate of the University of Denver College of 
Law.  Kimbra’s practice primarily focuses on agricultural and real estate issues, 
probate and estate administration, estate planning, and business organization and 
structuring. Kim currently serves as the county judge for Phillips County, 
Colorado. She will continue to practice in the Holyoke office. 
 
Tammy I. Kelley is a 2014 graduate of the University of Denver College of Law. 
Tammy has a transactional and estate planning practice.  Tammy will continue to 
practice in the Holyoke office. 
 
Established in 1857, Cline Williams is a full service law firm celebrating its 160th 
anniversary.  The firm presently has 60 attorneys representing and assisting 
individual and institutional clients. The firm currently has 32 lawyers included in one 
or more of the notable best lawyers lists published in the United States. With the 
addition of a second Colorado office, the firm has six offices across Nebraska in 
Omaha, Lincoln, Aurora and Scottsbluff, and Fort Collins and Holyoke Colorado. 
 
To learn more about the firm, our attorneys, and information on current issues that 
may impact our clients, visit our website at www.clinewilliams.com. 
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